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Book Reviews 

Radon and the Environment, by William J. Makofske and Michael R. Edel- 
stein (Eds.) Noyes Publications, Park Ridge, NJ, 1988, ISBN 0-8155-1161- 
2,465 pp., $39.00. 

The book is an attempt to document all the papers presented at a conference 
held at Ramapo College of New Jersey in 1986. The information in the book is 
of historical value. The field of radon is rapidly developing and, therefore, the 
readers should consult current literature for revised data. 

The book is divided into eight sections: (1) Introduction, (2) The geo- 
graphic distribution of radon, (3) Transmission and mitigation of radon, (4) 
Testing and measurement, (5) Radon and health, (6) Perception of risk, and 
psychosocial impacts of radon exposure, (7) Socioeconomic impacts of the 
radon issue, and (8) The role of government in responding to radon gas ex- 
posure. Each section in the book includes a summary of the papers presented 
during the session. The papers are short and well written. I read most of them 
and enjoyed reading the material in each paper. The book includes three help- 
ful appendices for a beginner in the field. Appendix-l contains a glossary of 
technical terms and Appendix-2 is a list of references on radon. The addresses 
for state radiological health program contacts are given in Appendix-3. 

The editors have done a good job in presenting all the papers in the same 
format and including the answers to questions asked during each session. Ad- 
ditional papers which were not presented at the conference are included in 
order to make the coverage of the subject more comprehensive. The book is 
recommended to environmental scientists as a reference for general informa- 
tion on radon. 

ASHOK KUMAR 

Spill Reporting Procedures Guide, by J.E. Leemann, BNA Books, Edison, NJ, 
1989, ISBN O-8719-609-0,400 pp., $140.00. 

A spill or unintentional release into the environment normally requires the 
spiller to report that release to one or more government agencies. The report- 
ing requirement depends on what, how much and where the material was spilled. 
This guide was developed to assist industry in meeting those requirements. 

The Spill Reporting Procedures Guide is divided into two major sections: 
Federal Reporting Requirements and State Reporting Requirements (all 50 
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